CODE

CITY OF REDMOND
ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,
WASHINGTON, AMENDING RMC CHAPTERS 15.08,
BUILDING CODE; 15.12, ELECTRICAL CODE; 15.14,
MECHANICAL CODE; 15.16, PLUMBING CODE; 15.18,
ENERGY CODE, TO UPDATE THE CITY’S BUILDING AND
CONSTRUCTION CODES TO REFLECT CURRENT STATE
STANDARDS
WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.031 mandates that all cities use and
enforce the State Building Code adopted by the State Building Code

Council; and

WHEREAS, effective February 1, 2021, the State Building Code
Council has adopted the 2018 Editions of the International Building
Code, International Residential Code, International Mechanical

Code, Uniform Plumbing Code and 2020 National Electrical Code; and

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27A.20 mandates that all cities wuse and
enforce the current versions of the Washington State Energy Code

adopted by the State Building Code Council.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,

WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Page 1 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



Section 1. Classification. This ordinance is of a general and

permanent nature and shall become a part of the City Code.

Section 2. Amendment of Chapter. RMC 15.08, Building Code, is

here hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.08
BUILDING CODE*

Sections:

15.08.010 Short title.

15.08.020 Adoption.

15.08.030 Public inspection.

15.08.040 Deletions.

15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building Code.

15.08.055 Amendments to the International Existing Building
Code.

15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential Code.

15.08.070 Complete application for permit.

15.08.080 Enforcement and penalties.

*Prior legislation: Ords. 1926, 2014, 2215 and 2833. Formerly
Chapter 20E.10 RCDG.

15.08.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute the
“Building Code” of the City and may be cited as such.

(Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord.
2346 § 1 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 2 (part), 2004)

Page 2 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.010
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.020
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.030
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.040
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.055
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.060
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.070
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.080

15.08.020 Adoption.

The International Building Code, [2845+ 2018 Edition,
published by the International Code Council, with the additions,
deletions and exceptions as set forth in Chapter 51-50 of the
Washington Administrative Code, and the International
Residential Code, [2645} 2018 Edition, published by the
International Code Council, with the additions, deletions and
exceptions as set forth in Chapter 51-51 of the Washington
Administrative Code, are hereby adopted by this reference and
incorporated herein as if set forth in full as the Building Code
for the City, except such portions as may be deleted, modified
or amended by this chapter.

The Building Official may use the appendices for guidance in
interpreting and administering the Building Code and the
provisions of this chapter. Further, the following appendix
chapters are specifically adopted.

International Building Code:

Appendix E, Supplemental Accessibility Requirements;
Appendix I, Patio Covers

International Residential Code:

Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping; except
for liquefied petroleum gas installations;

Appendix B, Size of Venting Systems Serving Appliances
Equipped with Draft Hoods, Category 1
Appliances and Appliances Listed for Use and
Type B Vents;

Appendix C, Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and
Direct-Vent Venting Systems;

Appendix F, Passive Radon Gas Controls;
Appendix H, Patio Covers;

[Appendix © U], Dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems

15.08.030 Public inspection.

Page 3 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-50
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-51

The City shall at all times keep on file with the City
Clerk, for reference by the general public, not less than one

copy of the codes and resolutions,
adopted by reference,

or parts thereof,

together with the amendments and
supplements thereto herein made a part of this chapter.

as herein

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the City Clerk

in the custody of the Building Official in order to make them

more readily available for inspection and use by the general

public.

(Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord.
2346 § 1 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 2

15.08.040 Deletions.

(part), 2004)

The following sections of the International Building Code,
[2645+ 2018 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1.Section 113

2.Section 105.

3.Section 105.

4.Section 101.

— Board of Appeals.

1.

1

4.

1 - Annual Permit.
.2 — Annual Permit Records.
4 - Property Maintenance.

The following sections of the International Residential
Code, [2845+ 2018 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Section R112 - Board of Appeals.

2. Chapters 11 and 25 through 43

(WAC 51-51).

15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building Code.

The following sections of the International Building Code
adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1.Amend Section 101.1, Title.

Page 4 of 49

Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-51

These regulations shall be known as the “Building Code of the
City of Redmond,” hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

2 .Amend Section 101.4, Referenced Codes.

The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through [+04-4-7#]
101.4.6 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to the
prescribed extent of each such reference.

101.4.1 Gas. The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code
as adopted in Chapter 15.14 RMC shall apply to the installation
of gas piping from the point of delivery, gas appliances and
related accessories as covered in this code. These requirements
apply to gas piping systems extending from the point of delivery
to the inlet connections of appliances and the installation and
operation of residential and commercial gas appliances and
related accessories.

101.4.2 Mechanical. The provisions of the International
Mechanical Code as adopted in Chapter 15.14 RMC shall apply to
the installation, alteration, repair and replacement of
mechanical systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures,
fittings and/or appurtenances, including ventilating, heating,
cooling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems,
incinerators and other energy-related systems.

101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the Uniform Plumbing Code as
adopted in Chapter 15.16 RMC shall apply to the installation,
alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances, and where connected to a water or sewage system
and all aspects of a medical gas system. The provisions of the
State of Washington requirements for private sewage disposal
shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.

101.4.4 Property Maintenance is not adopted

101.4.5 Fire Prevention. The provisions of the International
Fire Code as adopted in Chapter 15.06 RMC shall apply to matters
affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises from
the hazard of fire and explosion arising from the storage,
handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from
conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the
occupancy of structures or premises; and from the construction,
extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression and

Page 5 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1506.html#15.06

alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the
premises from occupancy or operation.

101.4.6 Energy. The provisions of the Washington State Energy
Code as adopted in Chapter 15.18 RMC shall apply to all matters
governing the design and construction of buildings for energy
efficiency.

101.4.7 Existing Buildings. The provisions of the International
Existing Building Code shall apply to matters governing the
repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition to and
relocation of existing buildings.

3.Amend Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit.

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be
required for the following:

Building:
1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and
storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor

area does not exceed [+28] 200 square feet (18.58 m?).

2. Fences not over 7 feet (2,134 mm) high.

3. [6i1—derrieks] Repealed by Ord. 2452.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219 mm) in
height measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of the
wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II or
IITI-A liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does
not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and the ratio of height to
diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

6. Sidewalks, driveways and detached decks not more than 30
inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not over any basement
or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

Page 6 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops
and similar finish work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets
and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R-3
occupancy, as applicable in Section 101.2, which are less than
24 inches (610 mm) deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L)
and are installed entirely above ground.

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes and not including service systems.

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached
one- and two-family dwellings.

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not
project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the exterior wall
and do not require additional support of Group R-3, as
applicable in Section 101.2, and Group U occupancies.

13. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and
partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (1,753 mm) in height.

Electrical:

1. Repairs and maintenance:

o] AN A A+ £ 1 amra r + 1] Ao A~ 2 A £
It crCc— COoOtC Tt O—C<T

, e . : , . 1ied
reeceptaetes—1 Class A Basic Electrical Work as defined in RCW
19.28.006.

2. Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of
this code shall not apply to electrical equipment used for
radio and television transmissions but do apply to equipment
and wiring for power supply, the installations of towers and
antennas.

3. Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for
the installation of any temporary system required for the
testing or servicing of electrical equipment or apparatus

4. Electrical and telecommunications utility companies: The
provisions of this code shall not apply to electrical and
telecommunications utility companies as specified in RCW 19.28
and WAC 296-46B.

A +
& o

nor 1
POt

QNI Y
UMPpP LUV

Page 7 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/rcw.pl?cite=19.28.006
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/rcw.pl?cite=19.28
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B

Gas:
1. Portable heating appliance.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of
equipment or make such equipment unsafe.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliance.

2. Portable ventilation equipment.
3. Portable cooling unit.

4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or
cooling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its approval or
make it unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds
(4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant and actuated by motors of 1
horsepower (746 W) or less.

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent
pipe provided, however, that if any concealed trap, drain pipe,
water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes
necessary to remove and replace the same with new material, such
work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be
obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes,
valves or fixtures, and the removal and reinstallation of water
closets, provided such repairs do not involve or require the
replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

4 .Amend Section 105.3.2 Time limitation of application.

An application for permit for any proposed work shall be deemed
to have been abandoned [+86+ 365 days after the date of filing,
unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a
permit has been issued; except that the building official is

Page 8 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for
additional periods not exceeding [864 365 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated.

5. Amend Section 105.5 Expiration.

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the
site authorized by such permit is commenced within [+86] 365
days after its issued, or if the work authorized on the site by
such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of [+88] 365
days after the work is commenced. The building official is
authorized to grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time,
for periods not more than ++86] 365 days each. The extension
shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated.

[4]6. Amend Section 109.2, Schedule of Permit Fees.

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for
each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with
Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.030, Application Requirements,
as said section currently exists or is hereafter amended,
modified or recodified.

7. Amend Section 109.3, Building permit wvaluations.

The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit
value at time of application. Permit valuations shall include
total value of work, including materials and labor, for which
the permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas, mechanical,
plumbing equipment and permanent systems. If, in the opinion of
the building official, the valuation is underestimated on the
application, the permit shall be denied, unless the applicant
can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the building
official. Final building permit valuation shall be set by the
building official. Construction valuations for new square
footage shall be calculated according to, IBC Building Area
definition.

[5] §.Amend Section 109.4, Work Commencing Before Permit
Issuance.

Any person who commences any work on a building, structure,
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining

Page 9 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



the necessary permits shall be subject to a special
investigation fee. The investigation fee shall be equal to the
amount of the permit fee that would be required by this code if
a permit were to be issued. An investigation fee, in addition to
the permit fee, may be collected whether or not a permit is then
or subsequently issued. The payment of such investigation fee
shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

[€]9.Add Section 113, Means of Appeal.

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
Building Official related to the application or interpretation
of this code shall be made pursuant to Redmond Zoning Code
Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of Type I and II Permits, as said
section currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recodified.

The provisions of this section shall not preclude the Building
Official from convening a Code Advisory Body comprised of
members who are qualified by experience and training to pass on
matters pertaining to building construction.

[#] 10.Amend Section 116.3, Notice.

If an unsafe condition is found, the building official shall
serve on the owner, agent or person in control of the structure
as provided in RMC Section 15.08.080, Enforcement and Penalties.

[€] 1l1l.Amend Section 116.4, Method of Service.

The notice and order and any amended or supplemental notice
and/or order shall be served as provided in RMC Section
15.08.080, Enforcement and Penalties.

A CAan~t2~n EN/4 2
O —oCC T [SAv A arae)

OTT

Page 10 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.080
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.080

~
z

o
SN

T
O+ h
\CASE S n
ran

n
A= vars

Y
Ty OF
.
_
(& s N wy & e )
1tz
-
o
Sy ) \Jll_L_Y
704

n

o
0
N
£V
o
= )
~
ah 1]
oot

+ 1
0
1
TOTTOWITIg
ot
o T TTOTT
3
o
e
2
K
(A
o

O NI o g

Lo LU UMPTITO LTS .
o

n

3

LI AW L W I
TIIC T T otT

A

mh ] sz

nt
oo T Ty

o .
3
aa
EEw=
aotTST
7 o
"+
It =T
1o
T—O=T
n
4
I~
o CtTTTOTT
1 o+ o
702

T UITrcaoy
o

T TO0OT
nat+h

oy Ay A\ AW AW § I

= A

£
-
[ S N N N Sy

3
3

n
cC OIS

7

o~
[CAAR o g )
+h
cIIc
P

s

TIT 1O
=

T
a £1
A8
+
Lla_y
11
v o 1T T
s
o~

1

[ g e my
Ty o Lo

CTIT
+h

W Il
Aol 7

O o

o TTE T
o

Tt JYuLoto
=

LR

A F£1

<

-

=

ot
£

O~z

nat g~

T COtotTraCtTtIOT

"

S A

S

n
o

7

G I N
W LT CTT
S I ~a Wllille
Aot o
nat i1~

[ 1 I AW S A W A A
1 ey

T
.
=
o
2%
1 ey

O o

o TTE T
n

n

i
n

14
-
o

3

o

<74 o
K
.

Ty

a <

e T T

3
RN 2
v

N

ISN

7
N

n
+
o

SO JalirCc T Ot
n

z

1T CUoOTT o C T OCT T ITUIT

has
J\JU—L_L\J._LJ.J.\j
-

anA D_D
[SEzaws

TR

AT N
[SESAv IEEeAS) S4e B ape ey ey

WITC T T Tlt

151
CTrTraoaKkCc—0O<T

I
N

N

+
-
-
C IO
e
TYPE
:
L)t/\./\./_l_u_l_ t/J_UV_Lg_)_LUJ.J.u
4 e

A I BRI I AT
n

1
s
P R
J_\_/\iu_LJ_\_,\_A. LI

PR R~

CTIT

N

A aIT

ot
CTIITTOCT

n

<z

o

EIe

PN SRS

Oxz

2y

i

+
TYyMPT

PNE TR 2
INIAWANIES)]
(A e arare
o
1
PO veTT
o
oot oy
=
++ A
oy oC—pCTrimrrccct
o
o
P
—

RN 2
13

fa a2 I Y

rrm g
n

n
o3

1 ere
£
TOTE
+ 1
[Srrae

viy COoOIrocrrotTtcICOIrs.
o

no_o
A [ S
na
3
O
aon
COoOTroT=x&
14
7
n
AWAVAN
n
ISESN
TC S PO StT
A M
Ty ot
ISESN
ISEEESC2N
~
o
rat s £
TacCctr

3

3

n

3
WITCTTT

wh
r
TN

K]
11aanAd
oottt
)
=0
nea
s
cO— oo O IiIgsS
ESE N |
i
cy Pt
+ 1
TIIC
L
T O0OT

oS g Tl Tror Iy

+ s 7
LT CT™K O UpMpMPULLTC LIy 8 TTIT

oo
2 R £1

[ N ) ) A Ay WSy Wy

Aot o
u\./t/(./LJ_(./L (AL w §

ratad

o

71
n
r

T Y=
I v oy

o
o
o~
o T TITOITS
n
12N
o
0
+ 1
| ¥ A
PO oL agtTio .

o
n
T
=
o
o
4
(& i s tJCJ_lllLlalaC\A
-
K
oot oA
T O TTTC T =TT
s
£
[N S . S

3
+ I~
T rrCo o tT—CaorrtoT
—
WA W
TIoT
rm o
z
137
TIT
r

n
n

7

S
o
o
+

TS oI oScITve

3

IS
ToT—
<

o

=0
IS
TOTT

ah 1]

1 ey
o

o

+hh o
CIictt
Ty

=

3

L
[ & = e = T I A S o S e -1y pLUYULTT T TCTU Oy
O]

K

o
=5
1A
N
—
a1 o
E

O o
o
T

QD o]

(=4
T TITT

o
J.I.I.LA._Y Ly
+4+ A

[ S N N W i Py @) BN ) ) t/CJ.LLlJ.L_L_CM S Y
PN
]

LTTITTCOC I T TOoO T utJtJLLCLJ

o
o
LT TS
-7

3
=
o

oS
K

Iz
N
o
oo oy
ST
1 ey
~
—~
L

e
TS
e
TS
oo
1T~
o
11
Ha
ootS
14
—
cO—CL
oo
—
Fany

7
2
cCItCT
1
11 A

\

S TSI v s ay e s ay S A
WITC T T o - TOWCT T It

A
r
T
O+ h
£V

I

i i g

OO Y o
ot Uupaliic 1ITo

1

g
s
oo o

T 1T e J—’

o

n
=

-
T U\/\/ULJ_L
o]

)
A

13

irharasaa
o £
tJCJ_lLl_LL_l—C\J- [ S

~ 11

EEEA
S i e
O
1o
TIIrCT
1
-~
TIT
dod
O CCT—ataCT

o

i
|
LTI TC T O CTTTICT T
27
e e
S
.
<73

TITC OUrrOUriialrcT
TIIC oo TToOTriry

o
Th
Th
2 D £

O
O

o

o

2
<z
nt+h
TTTrroTs
]

N

n

\"A=2 3 pea e n

0
0
P
cOoo=T

T T T o ooy

(N

LR W L N W o I N W 23 2 2 e 1
ISASTSENE AT AT RO e AT A e

U T e 15,
T T OWCT
A 77 B

T 4
LT T 1O
Tl o
LT 1T 15
T

LT T 1O
5

P

T
LTI 15
T
ENA
o]
=

e
.
tJJ_\J
[C Y ELw ¥

no

-

o

-

Iz

RN

r
=

+h

P S

1
=

m sz
Ty &

ek L E A E L L
oCcLroCcTur

Q

neyr

N

i
(A=Y = TA = ey ¥ AT

faE Rt Y

LLL/LLJ LS
O
No.

1026\
T

A\ AW AW ) wy t/.LUV.LO_LUllO
A hxr O St
3 an
7
Ordinance
AM No.

o117
T TCTTTOTIT

ot

S

r

o o
+ o

Ay O CTIT
T

cCtO—TS
i

oL
nat ¥yt A
oottt o
Zz2aoant o1
TTOTT - A O0Trca T I
~ T A27\
T

N

o
o

N
ot o
C1TOUTT

7

5101\

oI/

alh 1 1
oI 1T T

W DA

oot

o

o

n
T TS

ot
C1TOUTT
My
lll()._y
o/

[w A
1 rrIasza
o
g —yw)
o

17+,
L/L_I__I__Y
PR
T QL.L/L-LJ—VVL/L_YQ
3
g
= -

E =Y
N
T

r

T sz
0 )
1
cCTT TTOoOT

TCyYy ML

(+ 7

Page 11 of 49

A




3 n o

O+
PTTOoOITos

Pl B L
[=A g aas b

ot~ A
—OoOCTaoT

12N
o

alh 11

ner Aaa~ming <z
T g

-1

-1

v [~

2 D £

N gt ot £
g
A Foromn
A AYAVAW §

Py

<

o=y [ Y & yu mn m

TLO O

JE e W W e

TIT

T T T T CITC Ot

beots

R T IR
i O W It TIT
2R £1
>
+ 1

T ratr An A o~~~ £
oG — St COoTt
A

£

T

i s e
mih <z
oS o Cto Ty

T L CIrtr

TT

W

1 ey

1

r /oo

S S A e

+h

b1 n

3

(S AW AW pu my e mp W i 5

n
LTIt

o

3

e Walal

1 ey

1

£1 /e
[ S N N N

oy

T

cO—CTritc
o Al

o

Ty

M <

N

mi]
o T

o

o
TLO O

~
T

11 rad hsy TDO QA4+ ~ BE1Nn 2
OOy TD A= v ary

~
T

o

o
TCO O

=}

(S P AV S ey

T TCTTTOTIT

4

SASE=ES

o=y

T e I ey

a1 o BE1N0

n
o

n o

-1

o

-1

= AT

QA

g <z
Oy

P i B

~

POV oS ITUITS A\ U B W i S E w ) [ S B & 5\ U U W i iy & I M g iy @ 9§

SPeCTa=T
2 LD £1

SASE=ES

3 maiam

1

TIT LI TITLCLLIT o

2 1D M

arnmih] 2 A et N
Mmoo T —0C

el

1 ey

1

r /o

[ S S W W iy

Q1N N 4
SuppPpotTcTig

TIr

Co Ty oo CTiio T o

TIr

73 o

Vv

AL

v iy £ £

£

hoss

aszat Ao

~

1

1

[ e === )

Qg o

—
[ S N S )
+1 £
W LT CTIT
M

T30

Y - OO0 T OW

- OO0

1

A
o oW e TG

T v O

AR 2 U cO

= e iy

3

+
TIITOE Lol Tco aolllifglitfcrTa c T Ul .

S a9~

raom

S A

o

Iz

EE dornagrtmant S g

I3

[EE N B T @ A ) S e B mp e g Ay e

+ A n

OIrr C

11

a1 oy

o

+ r
oIrrc  OT

11 7

1 ey

11

P SN
W LT CTIITTIT

dor
EZivas) SASE sy 3 g

faBE R X1

[ 2 B e B 2

IO T

A\ vy

O LT TP TITY

IITCZ 2Ol tIrT o

+oh
oW LT CCIIT o .

IR R X1

~

AW B TN
T

T

£ - <z £
J N NP VA NP

n

1

e et e
J_\_,\iu_LJ_\./

CTI o T

T OW

T OO0

3~

e s o

hoxr

1a aho71
LTV TTIO
S+l

[& e

1 Iz

N o AAand 1 o £
rrcoratircTIoT

T Ao
|\ S Sy S W B W g Sy | 1T

o

ITTV T AU CUIMmToO T 1Io

O ITO T
£

[ e W e

Nt iz
CIrcrTy

dornagrt+man+

r

3

T T U O CIncTITC

n

3

+
orrrralrrora c o ort

DA a9~

+h

W CIT

n_ 179

3

ot
O ITIOINCT AT T T T TIUIT

Aot

o

[ i

n

ot

oo At

£ T
g
4

o

o

M.

r_ran

+

T IO T T orrirarrcracor

S a1~

raom

N I,
[N S . S @7 N By @p R S R 4 §

alh~11

TITCTTITS T o o0 o Tt o T TTUrT

oo

IS A

o

X7 o

EWA P ER
cotC—attrrcooaooTre—GC

o

1 19
A=

nad sy £1
[ARSESAAS s & a4

Z

SN

LT T 0 e

[ S S W W iy

olra L L O

1029
E=

n

ot 2
oo o T IUIT

Nt o o

m
EEA AT v gu S 2y S 1 1 Ay 3 ey )

rooyilg e

wal la okl o171 + 1

~

o
|\ S S N BN

o

|y ¥ a

[ 3] & 3= Syn Suy 1 § A ) Wy vy

Wt O

1 ey

ot

137

o1 ot
oot ot ve

1
JE g s i g

T CTIiTY .

1loeatrad

SN

comihl <z a1 1

el

1 ey

1

3

r /o
T T OUL7CTCTT Ity aooCTiiioLy

2 D £

N yna e £+
O

X

beats

o T T T™X

[SF T & 3= ipn Sauu WA wy

TIr

T
g Fromm
wo OGO ———Tamc

TIT I T CITC O

oD

TIr

Th

r

oA £

o

S A

+

1 o

£

T.7

n

TIIC

Tt [SASASAWE S ¥ [ S ) W W

T T LT oC
mh ] 7
TS S Ttio Ty

T TWTTTT

£

1 ey

1

N

r /o
S S w7 W Ty

2D £1

+ 1

N

N

= A A
o OO T TOTT

n
o

W=l

3 1 3~

(= e R AT

r /o
mih <7

T OO0

| S A S 5 i S A 5
S Al +h

TS
TR <

N

Soaanmih
1115 g g

r
=

10 2
o T U.

n

R,
T J o CITUIT

a sz
OO0y

P S e

r
=

o

o
(& yeye)

OO

[y yaw s O CTT

oL

oy

[ I Aoy

annta1 -~ BN
o tCTTTOTT

n oo n
It

ISRV B B - -G T -

g sz

EEA AT v g iy e s

o117

Lo tcuoararLr L LDaolrd

O LU .

To L MUV IO ITUITS

OoT

AL

r sy £ r £

[ S ) W

nhosr

aszat Ao+

r
=

1

1

[ S == ¢ ==

Qg o

[ S W W T IO A\ 8 VIO =]

MY

Ay IV

TThO

Oy o

iy

T+~
oW I CTCIT

IR R 2]

~

S Al 4 o
[Sxsavs

AL

£

Iz

NAdant £
O T

1Tndan
THHOCT

P S

~

CaIt o T O .

- T L TOW

[ S ) W

oL

No.

Ordinance

Page 12 of 49

AM No.



I o

P g

a1 71 vy

1

- £ - <z

n

o

~
T

T Ao IS
|\ E B W 1 W7 S B W i

g

T CcOommaorc O

ITCroaLr L OO T T ollaar L rrav

[Sa==aw

2

o £f Txvrnaa At~ g n
O g oo Ottt OTt
a

Maoan

TICatto
caalk]
oo THIo T

PoITT T

r ol

+
TCmMo T C—aOrtorrtCTraotcoT

A 19 g

N TN I VY- C SN

1

S S E S SR @ R i @ 1

£
ah 11

o
vV O

Iz 3

A A
[Savav ==

NnedA sy £
Oy

—~
Z-OTT

12N
o

=}

A

O

S e W W

[ Y & gu mpm m

a

N

£
o T 1o LT

PN SN PN

nog—recurrem

TOTTOWIITY

T

A\ ary

[ S e o g

ITr

SASE=ES

[ i g CIT

T

WTT

3~

EUPE SN S

Sddra oo

hoxr

o ah 11

11

o Ca LW T IO

o Tsra 4+ Q4 o2 ey

o

£ N
OO T C T T o o2 C

Tovec—atOtrcooogioTTC—aoacoimtatc T

11

[ ) & i mp uy

Ao+

n

o

n

T

1d3 e

N

cCoO oo TUTrity

N TP
(@7 N By @p Sy R ) §

el

EAWANE LY i B W
IS REE ST

~
T

1+
W I CTIt

n

ot 2

TCO A= =aw ITOC T rocaoctOTtly

S A

T TCTTTOTIT

N

ot o
O C O T T UTT

o]
ITT T T T

o

n

3

4
Trrrroarrcoraoac ot OoOrt

L ¥ Smiraa o~
AW WA m

£

T O

T OIrcC

1 e

+
et TTITg

m

£ Dafir

-

+r

hoxr

1 gl ]l o
oo wC TS

3 cb o

i
T TCCT oo TOXTC

lalal

£ N

INO OO

LI LU

TITTC = I TTr A

Ry

1000 £
-

n

ot 2
oo o T IUIT

TR

A

\CA v

PSP EEE N ]
ZASAYAT Y =ie s s puye)

40

o
cAaAa T T T e

n

2 a1

1

Oy o
\TATAeavy Tie sy pe

£

+r

Oy o

Th

ITOT

LT [ g & = g =

[ S o B oL Up LT [ SN N

FEESWA|

+r

Oy g

+r

o7

o

Th

Qoxt1g o

r £ o + 740
TOOTT S —0OL

LTI OCT A=Ay AU N WL W § oL Up LT [ SN N

R R LT T T T

“T

7

|S ¥ P AW s ww g

=

o iz PRSP
[ S i ) Uk/k/ut/_l_\./u
ot

n

-

-

=

N

v

N

COoOIToTOT T T T ottt

o
alh 11

o

o n

el

o

OO0

S CULY .

(S AWy my e mp W i g @ i

TIoCT

T

T CTTho

131389 e
T CTaCT g

1
alh 11

PSP EEE SN ]
ZASAYAT Y =ie s s puye)

N = A 20N
CAHRCCCG—Soo

oA
OO — STt

Oy o
\TATApvy Tie sy pe

cOtaTy

ToT
o A

e

1 o

1

TWO oCcCarrwoTLTo

3 g

o o

My

o

nan QN

r £ o
TOoO0To
I

EEESWA|

el

o

ol L L Cz2xCc oIt

O MPTUTT O .

I OpPTIT

|Z ¥ P AW s ww g

AL TTO

o

o

-
T OoOT O CTxXCTCTTToS

SRR
o T TTOpPTITC

~ £
[ S A N

O o
cCIrc— OC T oOp T T

v

v

“T

WITC T T

OO0

I

O

+hh a1 A

n

o
TR T T T T T

n

e - PP N |
[H S N N
£

+ 1

=

v

=
TIrc—orco OT

TIoCT CIrt O OTL

[ ') & iy mp uy

cCIrc— OC T oOp T T

+ 1 ooy a o

=

o

NS I 2Y
T

v

me o
oo T

v

133N

+ 1

=

v

=
cCIIrCc—orcTco OT

CIIrICc—orcTco OT cIrc— oCc T op o™

- OO0

=3 S A=

PAEEWS
ESASAS ACASASAS s S

| ¥ A

o n

[ 2 e e B 2

r _m

L4 o
[ SN Ey e ) A\ =

z

oY

=

o

+h

z

a

1+

2N

alh 11

£V £+
TO0T
+ 1

o Zzalrrires OU1tt

Iy

I O T A -

[SF 3] & = ipn Sauuy WA wy

P =
F 45 ANy w [ S N U Sy

133y

=3 S A=

I

+h Oy N

12N ~AAA~AA

S a1 1

1

Oy N
o T opTIiTc

£V £+
TO0T

Th

T oo Uupalltc ESAw e AW §

iy
£

OO O ITO 110 T [CAw AW AW 5

A £

)
+1h +h

WL CIT

+h

At ~rma
cO— G T

1+

11NN A e

+h

1+

1

OOy N o
T oo Uupalltc

I3

I

[ S W W iy

UMMM T LINTU ST

I

O [ S

S~k
CaCTr

1da

£

£ o
T TTI T 1O TS

1
[ SN N

nhoxr

1ao
CJLUIITUNM LT POT O

QAL Q4+ o A

n

PR
[\ W2 U 5 W i

[ SN AN

[ S

T v O

Ry

T

riza e~ 1 £
STV Ig

o

3 g

o o

3

o
T T T OO A\ a N Sy o

o

o

T OU 1 .

T

o Cca L L wWo DT

v
T

Iz

[ S N v o iy

m ]

na £
cCTr

z+

P N I

|\ B W U & B W W iy

n
IXIT

¥ ¥ g W

cO

PR 3 5 i i W W

T OTIT

A=

[ ') & iy mpm uy

+1 g e
T I T CITrCItt

WL CIT

T

Vil
“r

m + TN 2ANYD
meecTc——=—5

ot o Py S I

TIrc— o TrTvaoTcorT

o

Iz

T v T o

[PAvAv)

[ ) & iy mpm uy

T

+ Iy 7 £

T

3 n

o
|\ I B 1 A W A W e

n

o

ol

—CTTTs

“r

A\

[ S >y & i

£

r
A A\ [ SN AN

O o

ESENEYS

haoarao (DT
T T T/

3 o
CIrIITga T oliT

1 eyls

+

£2 o

EV I N |
T O CaloxT

D

Ay

[ S

10

S S

o

17

=

o

noaxr

= PR o
[ s

o

1 T

PR

+

L A = [ 0 Ei N & S W o T

)

T

oOCa L LW T 1T O .

T C

T

TP T

r o

1

1

1
[ e === )

[QENERS

A

1

1

[ e === 3 )

ar ¥y o~

r

N

£
[ S N N Y

ahoa11 W

r

=
T

PR NEL

o

AV LT NN

Q

o o )

S S PR W By
£

[SF 3 1o gu mp mppy WA
Adad

TTC oottt TO0T
ah 11

=3 Sae 2

T+~
oW I cCIT

sk R X1

AL

NP P
L OCtJ(/l_L(/lk,C
JaN

T3
W T CTIT

nrosza

SN

+haa
T o

n
1T

T T OW

ST O PTrov IOt
g sz

-
=3 5 S S A S

-

1

113
WL T OT

r o

Iz

ov TS

o

o

1

Maorah ]

i

+1h

SNy Y7

el

13 ]

[EEFaws

IO T CTO

J I 1 & N S i & e Y

i e

I

OIrrTo o

No.

Ordinance

Page 13 of 49

AM No.



n

NDernyrtm o

~
p

Ial

1
iy

P AmanaA o

a <z
S S

rooyila
T

el

a

1

1

[ e === )

Qg o

[=A =) Sie =y ey

\TAw ¥

T

IOt

SASE=ES

T oo

-

laosral

a £ £V
N Vi e

AZANTA R g ) ) S e O

O g

o

dorad

AP W i /W B W B\ Wl S WA W R & B 3 8

+ 1
TIT

noq

a

Thae WL EL N BN

10
T

— O

A R A O = = A s e o

o
T30

= o
TG

T

n o

fal o

N

31 a3

OOy

ST

ah ot

WTIT

3 n

4
[} g Y 7 i W W

g o

4

\PAVS S Yo w §

T30

T

CIT

A

T

No.

Ordinance

Page 14 of 49

AM No.



Avon

£ QD*

——tand

L

%" w\_\\i‘

ll-l-‘
156TH AVE NE

)

196TH

H
E
g \ o
™,
N %,
g E By
—-f ga
st &
e T i
i 4.
s ®0% e /’ '
i | Figure 504.3A
AREAS ALLOWING TYPE V 5 STORY
: | WOOD FRAME CONSTRUCTION

+

Page 15 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



(Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016: Ord. 2822 § 1, 2016; Ord. 2787 § 1
(Exh. 1 and Att. C), 2015; Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord. 2596
§ 2 (part), 2011; Ord. 2452 § 2, 2009; Ord. 2346 § 1 (part),
2007: Ord. 2270 § 1, 2005; Ord. 2219 § 2 (part), 2004)

15.08.055 Amendments to the International Existing Building
Code.

1.105.2 Work Exempt from permit is not adopted. The provisions
for work exempt from permit as adopted in RMC 15.08.050, Item 3
shall apply.

2. 105.3.2 Time limitation of application. An application for a
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been
abandoned [+86] 365 days after the date of filing, unless such
application has been pursued in good faith or a permit has been
issued; except that the code official is authorized to grant one
or more extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding
[96] 365 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated.

3. 105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid
unless the work on the site authorized by such permit is
commenced within [+86] 365 days after its issuance, or if the
work authorized won site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of [+86] 365 days after the time the work
is commenced. The code official is authorized to grant, in
writing, one or more extensions of time for periods not more
than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated.

[2] 4.Section 112 Board of Appeals is not adopted. The
provisions for means of appeal as adopted in RMC 15.08.050, Item
[6] 9 shall apply.

[3] 5.115.3 Notice is not adopted. The provisions for Notice as
adopted in RMC 15.08.050, Item [7] 10 shall apply.

[4] 6.115.4 Method of Service is not adopted._The provisions for
Method of Service as adopted in RMC 15.08.050, Item [8] 11 shall
apply. (Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016)

15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential Code.

Page 16 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050

The following sections of the International Residential Code
adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1.Amend Section R101.1, Title.

These provisions shall be known as the “Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Redmond,” and shall
be cited as such and will be referred to as “this code.”

2 .Amend Section R102.4, Referenced codes and standards.

The referenced codes and standards shall be as specified in
Section 101.4 of the amended administrative provisions of the
International Building Code, Section 15.08.050, Redmond
Municipal Code.

3.Amend Section R105.2, Work exempt from permit.

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be
required for the following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures, provided the floor
area does not exceed 200 square feet (18.58 m?).

2. Fences not over 7 feet (2,134 mm) high.

3. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219 mm) in
height measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of the
wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

4. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does
not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and the ratio of height to
diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

5. Sidewalks, driveways, and detached decks not more than 30
inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not over any basement
or story below.

6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops
and similar finish work.

Page 17 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050

7.

(610 mm) deep.

8.

Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches

Swings and other playground equipment.

9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not

project more than 54 inches

(1,372 mm) from the exterior wall

and do not require additional support.

10.Decks not exceeding 200 square feet
are not more than 30 inches

are not attached

(18.58 m2)in area, that
(762 mm) above grade at any point,
to a dwelling and do not serve the exist door

required by Section R311.4.

[+6]

11. Light weight roof covering. Light weight roof covering

includes composition,

or metal roof covering, and similar

materials where the installed unit weight is less than 4 pounds

per square foot.

[++] 12. Removal

and replacement of interior doors in existing

door frames.

[+2] 13. Removal

and replacement of exterior windows in existing

window openings.

The size of opening may not be altered and

operable opening

size may not be decreased.

Electrical:

1 [Taat+rand ~nr A A ~T a9 A~~~ A A~ ancy A~ 0 < g

. | == ey e A8 A\ mp W § TTr t/_l_u\j CUTITTITC T T T l_Clll.t/u_LDL_L_y A\ 5\ UL UL U Sy @) i) Ui S VA
Hghting-—] Repairs and maintenance: A permit shall not be
required for Class A Basic Electrical Work as defined in

2 [Readrmeat T 4~ o S Ny P APNE AN SHIE N [ T DAV NP C AN SIS HDSNP I~ NN S S N

. [T ITo T LT T T 1L UIT e O CCTE TTITITCT T O t/_l_bl. [ . -y \_,t/ CTr [ Sy [ S N T T T
134+ 1 + o +h v ]
AU i e =y O CTIT - T U1« ]

2 [Rarnl o aman 4+ £ bhayranrn~h o~ Naa g oaroiirrant AAaczd Ao £ +1h

. e tJ_LL«L\., TTT TTC O LT TATTICTT |\ S S U W R Sy w Vv [ S NS U i S TTC A8 vV IO [=J O CTIT
VSR B 2N B NE NPV I T2 I~ S — = PR 1 PN ~ 1
J_\_,\iu_LJ_\_,\A. ut/u _LL_,_Y [ S T O AT [ T LU - ]

4 (n ot g AT rga ang o~ Ansza A~ N i NN = NN LV

1 e | == |\ WP Eu i WPy @ R VV_L_L_LLL\j, A8 VIO Q, ().tJtJ_L_L().LLK/ O, ().tJtJ()._L().L,L/lO O
TR IR N T Nnoarat+ g e~y 4 ] aa +h o DB 7 ~AT a0 A A A N
p\iu_LtJlLl\_,J.J.L, \Jt./\_,J_L/LL._LJ.J.\j T [ S N ) CITITTTT £ A\ Sy e ) (@R uaw T T L/LLJL/L)\J_L\_/

=N [IManmnar oo g o o] R IR T I B SN-C — Y roarn]l A A At £ 1o £V

D2 N O 3= S R EER ) e e m o WO Iy EEE S A juape s ey p AT TTIT T o PP T T TInTITC UL TaosS O
+1h om0 n £ e vz s SN ] ] ot vyt ~o ol rment  +
I o1 CTUIT UL opplrovoeo porcaoaorc ©oTT cCr oo YOI PmcTITCo cO
R A LYAR T W2 BE W NE S 2 SN AN i B S B~ WP SN a oot o~ o 1
1S3 54 S AT ) T Sy S R R 1 3 5 S 3 g e TITocaoarroco T o CTpPpTtacTcT oo ]

Gas:

Page 18 of 49

Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/rcw.pl?cite=19.28.006

1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of
equipment or make such equipment unsafe.

3. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a
fixed piping system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliance.

2. Portable ventilation equipment.
3. Portable cooling unit.

4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or
cooling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its approval or
make it unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds
(4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant and actuated by motors of 1
horsepower (746 W) or less.

8. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a
fixed piping system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent
pipe provided; however, that if any concealed trap, drain pipe,
water, soil, waste or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes
necessary to remove and replace the same with new material, such
work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be
obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes,
valves or fixtures, and the removal and reinstallation of water
closets, provided such repairs do not involve or require the
replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

4. Amend Section R105.3.2 Time limitation of application.
An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be

Page 19 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



deemed to have been abandoned [+88] §§§ days after the date of
filing unless such application has been pursued in good faith or
a permit has been issued; except that the building official is
authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for
additional periods not exceeding [+86] 365 days each. The
extension shall be required in writing and Jjustifiable cause
demonstrated.

5. Amend Section R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued
shall become invalid unless the work authorized by such permit
is commenced within [+86] 365 days after its issued or after
commencement of work if more than [+86] 365 days pass between
inspections. The building official is authorized to grant, in
writing, one or more extensions of time for periods not more
than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing
and justifiable cause demonstrated.

(4] 6.Amend Section R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On
buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and plumbing
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the Redmond Zoning
Code 21.76, as said section currently exists or is hereafter
amended, modified or recodified.

7. Amend Section R108.3 Building permit valuations.
Building permit valuations shall include total value of the work
for which a permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas,
mechanical, plumbing, equipment and other permanent systems,
including materials and labor. Construction valuations for new
square footage shall be calculated according to, IBC building
area.

[¢] 8.Amend Section R108.6, Work commencing before permit
issuance.

Any person who commences any work on a building, structure,
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining
the necessary permits shall be subject to a special
investigation fee. The investigation fee shall be equal to the
amount of the permit fee that would be required by this code if
a permit were to be issued. An investigation fee, in addition to
the permit fee, may be collected whether or not a permit is then
or subsequently issued. The payment of such investigation fee
shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Page 20 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



[#] 9.Add Section R112, Means of Appeal.

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
Building Official related to the application or interpretation
of this code shall be made pursuant to Redmond Zoning Code
Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of Type I and II Permits, as said
section currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recodified.

(8] 10.Amend Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic
Design Criteria.

Ground Snow Load = 15 psf
Wind Speed = 110 mph
Topographic effects = NO
Seismic Design Category = D2
Subject to Damage From
Weathering = Moderate

Frost Line Depth = 12"

Termite = Slight to Moderate

Decay = Slight to Moderate

Winter Design Temp. = 27 degrees F

Ice Shield Underlayment Required = No

Flood Hazards = Joined National Flood Insurance Program 1979

Current Flood Hazard Map - FIRM 1999
Air Freezing Index = 113

Mean Annual Temp. = 52 degrees F

[+8] 11.Add Section R11l5, Unsafe Structures and Equipment.

Unsafe structures and equipment are subject to the provisions
for unsafe structures and equipment as provided in RMC
15.08.050, amended Section 116 of the International Building
Code.

Page 21 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050

(Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord.
2596 § 2 (part), 2011; Ord. 2452 § 3, 2009; Ord. 2346 § 1
(part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 2 (part), 2004)

15.08.070 Complete application for permit.

Determination of whether a building permit application is
complete for purposes of administering Redmond Zoning Code
Chapter 21.76, Review Procedures, shall be made by the Building
Official and shall be based upon the adopted building codes.

(Ord. 2833 § 2 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord.
2596 § 2 (part), 2011: Ord. 2346 § 1 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219
§ 2, 2004)

15.08.080 Enforcement and penalties.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to
comply with any of the requirements thereof, at the discretion
of the Building Official, shall be subject to the enforcement
and penalties provided in RMC Chapter 1.14. (Ord. 2833 § 2
(part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 3 (part), 2014: Ord. 2346 § 1 (part),
2007: Ord. 2219 § 2 (part), 2004)

Chapter 15.12
ELECTRICAL CODE¥*

Sections:

15.12.010 Short title.

15.12.020 Adoption.

15.12.030 Public inspection.

15.12.040 Deletions.

15.12.050 Amendments.

15.12.060 Penalties for wviolations.

Page 22 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.010
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.020
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.030
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.040
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1512.html#15.12.060

*Prior legislation: Ords. 2014 and 2215. Formerly Chapter 20E.20
RCDG.

15.12.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute the
“Electrical Code” of the City and may be cited as such.

(Ord. 2887 § 2 (part), 2017: Ord. 2729 § 5 (part), 2014: Ord.
2346 § 3 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 4 (part), 2004)

15.12.020 Adoption.

The National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), [26+%] 2020 Edition
and effective July 1, [284%F] 2020, the [263++] 2020 Edition,
published by the National Fire Protection Association, with the
additions, deletions and exceptions as set forth in Chapter 296-
46B WAC is hereby adopted by this reference and incorporated
herein as if set forth in full as the Electrical Code for the
City, except such portions as may be deleted, modified or

amended by this chapter.

The Building Official may use the annexes for guidance in
interpreting and administering the Electrical Code and the
provisions of this chapter. Further, the following annex
chapters are specifically adopted:

Annex A, Product Safety Standards;

Annex B, Application Information for Ampacity
Calculation; and

Annex C Conduit and Tubing Fill Tables for
Conductors and Fixture Wires of the
Same Size.

(Ord. 2887 § 2 (part), 2017: Ord. 2729 § 5 (part), 2014:
Ord. 2346 § 3 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 4 (part), 2004)

15.12.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the City
Clerk, for reference by the general public, not less than one
copy of the Codes and Resolutions, or parts thereof, as herein

Page 23 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B

adopted by reference,

together with the amendments and

supplements thereto herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the City
Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in order to make
them more readily available for inspection and use by the

general public.

(Ord. 2887 § 2
2346 § 3

(part),
(part), 2007:

15.12.040 Deletions.

2017:
Ord.

Ord. 2729 § 5
2219 § 4

(part),
(part), 2004)

2014:

The following sections of the National Electrical Code,
[264+7+] 2020 Edition and WAC Chapter 296-46B, Electrical

Safety Standards, Administration, and Installation, are
hereby deleted:

r1 DArt+ 1~ QN DAAdma g o+ PPN B RN SN S o = Th

LJ_. JF A W S G i \w vy [/ W\ B 1) 1) A N A A WD ) W Sy & N USSR S N R [ waw 5 i B 8 A A N NIV SN S WP ) ) B\ N R B Gy [ N A

£~1 1 PR L IR NPT S| na £ WAL OCharnt+a~r 200 ACD | At ra o~
J_\J_L_L\JVVLLl\j o o O CITOUTTO L\ LAF3Y J.J.(.;LtJL_C_L A\ _.[\JJ_), B I R N PR N WP R S Y @ R
[N SN S« SIENEEND N P S PENE RN RPNE SN S - eNUP PN M i P SN e NP P RSP BN
UDL.LCl—_Y [SASIE T P i@ Hupw Yo by I T ICITIT T o C OO T ImIUIT AT [ NN I S ) WP @ iy Mg By & iy W m W 9 ay (& g s
h ol z A 1 e

T CXoy A A m | |

Ord.

[2] 1. References to fees in WAC 296-46B-906, 296-46B-908,

296-46B-909,

296-

46B-911 and 296-46B-915.

[3] 2.
296-46B-995.

15.12.050 Amendments.

The following sections of the 2020 National Electrical Code
adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1.Add new Section 90.4(A), Administration. The amended

administrative provisions of the International Building

Code, Section 15.

08.050 Redmond Municipal Code,

shall

apply.

Electrical Board - Appeal Rights and hearings in WAC

2.Add new Section 90.4 (B), Basic Electrical Work. The Basic

Electrical Work definition and classification as specified

in RCW 19.28.006.

Page 24 of 49

Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-906
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-908
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-909
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-911
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-915
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=296-46B-995
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/rcw.pl?cite=19.28.006

3.Add new Section 90.4(C), Inspections. The installation,
alteration or extension of any electrical system, fixtures
or components for which an Electrical Permit is required by
this Code shall be subject to inspection by the Building
Official and such electrical systems, fixtures and
components shall remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes until approved by the Building
Official. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to
cause the electrical systems to remain accessible and
exposed for inspection purposes. The City shall not be
liable for any expense entailed in the removal or
replacement of material required to permit inspection.
Electrical systems and equipment requlated by the National
Electrical Code shall not be connected to the energy source
or energized until authorized by the Building Official.

4 .Add new Section 90.4 (D), Special Inspections. The
Building Official may require special inspection of
equipment or wiring methods where the installation requires
special training, equipment, expertise, knowledge, or other
such factors. Where such special inspection is required, an
independent third party acceptable to the Building Official
shall perform it. The special inspection person/agency
shall be designated and approved prior to beginning the
installation of wiring or equipment. The Building Official
prior to the installation being approved shall receive a
written report from the designated special inspection
agency indicating that the installation conforms to the
appropriate Codes and standards. All costs for such testing
and reporting shall be the responsibility of the permit
holder.

5.Add new Section 90.4 (E), Unused Conductors. Electrical
conductors not in use shall be removed unless otherwise
authorized by the Building Official.

6.Add new Section 90.4(F), Corrections. If, upon
inspection, any installation is found not to be fully in
conformity with this Code, the Building Official shall at
once forward to the person, firm, or corporation making the
installation a written notice stating the defects that have
been found to exist. Correction of these defects shall be
made within 15 days.

7.Add new Section 90.4(G), Approval of Violations. Approval
as a result of an inspection shall not be construed to be

Page 25 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



an approval of a violation of the provisions of the
National Electrical Code or other laws or ordinances of the
City. Inspections presuming to give authority to violate or
cancel provisions of the National Electrical Code or other
laws or ordinances of the City shall not be valid.

8. Add new Section 90.4 (H), Time limitation of application. An
application for permit for any proposed work shall be
deemed to have been abandoned 365 days after the date of
filing, unless such application has been pursued in good
faith or a permit has been issued; except that the building
official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of
time for additional periods not exceeding 365 days each.
The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable
cause demonstrated.

9. Add new Section 90.4 (I), Expiration. Every permit issued
shall become invalid unless the work on the site authorized
by such permit is commenced within [180] 365 days after its
issued, or if the work authorized on the site by such
permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 365 days
after the work is commenced. The building official is
authorized to grant, in writing, on or more extensions of
time, for periods not more than 365 days each. The
extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable
cause demonstrated.

10. Add new Section 90.4 (J) Schedule of Permit Fees. On
buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical and
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee
for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance
with Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.030, Application
Requirements, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

11. Add new Section 90.4 (K) Permit Valuations. The
applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit
value at time of application. Permit valuations shall
include total value of work, including materials and labor,
for which the permit is being issued, such as electrical,
equipment and permanent systems. If, in the opinion of the
building official, the valuation is underestimated on the
application, the permit shall be denied, unless the
applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval
of the building official. Final permit valuation shall be
set by the building official.

Page 26 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



12. Add new Section 90.4 (L) Work Commencing Before Permit
Issuance. Any person who commences any work on a building,
structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system
before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to
a special investigation fee. The investigation fee shall be
equal to the amount of the permit fee that would be
required by this code if a permit were to be issued. An
investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, may be
collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently
issued. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions
of this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

13. Add Section 113, Means of Appeal. Appeals of orders,
decisions or determinations made by the Building Official
related to the application or interpretation of this code
shall be made pursuant to Redmond Zoning Code Section
21.76.060(I), Appeals of Type I and II Permits, as said
section currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified
or recodified. The provisions of this section shall not
preclude the Building Official from convening a Code
Advisory Body comprised of members who are qualified by
experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to
building construction.

(Ord. 2887 § 2 (part), 2017: Ord. 2729 § 5 (part), 2014: Ord.
2535 § 1, 2010; Ord. 2346 § 3 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 4
(part), 2004)

15.12.060 Penalties for wviolations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects,
constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure electrical
system in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the building official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and
Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

(Ord. 2887 § 2 (part), 2017: Ord. 2729 § 5 (part), 2014: Ord.
2346 § 3 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 4 (part), 2004)

Page 27 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14

Chapter 15.14

MECHANICAL CODE*

Sections:

15.14.010 Short title.

15.14.020 Adoption.

15.14.030 Public inspection.

15.14.040 Deletions.

15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical Code.
15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code.
15.14.070 Penalties for violations.

Prior legislation: Ords. 1926, 2014, and 2215. Formerly Chapter

20E.60 RCDG.

15.14.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute the

“Mechanical Code” of the City and may be cited as such.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

Page 28 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.010
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.020
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.030
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.040
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.060
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1514.html#15.14.070

15.14.020 Adoption.

The International Mechanical Code, [263+5] 2018 Edition,
published by the International Code Council, with the additions,
deletions and exceptions as set forth in Chapter 51-52 WAC and
the International Fuel Gas Code, [264+5%+ 2018 Edition, published
by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted by this
reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in full as the
Mechanical Code for the City, except such portions as may be

deleted, modified or amended by this chapter.

The Building Official may use the appendices for guidance in
interpreting and administering the Mechanical Code and the
provisions of this chapter. Further, the following appendix

chapters are specifically adopted.

International Mechanical Code:

None

International Fuel Gas Code:

Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping; except

for liquefied petroleum gas installations;

Page 29 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-52

Appendix B, Size of Venting Systems Serving Appliances
Equipped with Draft Hoods, Category 1 Appliances

and Appliances Listed for Use and Type B Vents;

Appendix C Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and

Direct-Vent Venting Systems.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

15.14.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the City
Clerk, for reference by the general public, not less than one
copy of the codes and resolutions, or parts thereof, as herein
adopted by reference, together with the amendments and
supplements thereto herein made a part of this chapter. The
copies of the codes on file may be placed by the City Clerk in
the custody of the Building Official in order to make them more

readily available for inspection and use by the general public.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

Page 30 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



15.14.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the International Mechanical

Code, [2845] 2018 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Section 109 - Means of Appeal.

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas Code,

[2645] 2018 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Chapter 1 - Administration.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical Code.

The following sections of the International Mechanical Code

adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1.Amend Section 101.1, Title. These regulations shall be

known as the “Mechanical Code of City of Redmond,”

hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

2 .Amend Section 102.8, Referenced codes and standards. The
referenced codes and standards shall be as specified in

Section 101.4 of the amended administrative provisions of

Page 31 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



the International Building Code, Section 15.08.050 Redmond

Municipal Code.

3. Amend Section 106.3.3. Time limitation of application.

An application for a permit for any proposed work shall be

deemed to have been abandoned [180] 365 days after the date

of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good

faith or a permit has been issued; except that the code

official shall have the authority to grant one or more

extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding

[180] 365 days each. The extension shall be requested in

writing and justifiable case demonstrated.

[3] 4.Amend Section 106.4.1, Approved construction
documents. When the code official issues a permit where
construction documents are required, the construction

documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, as

FApproved”] “Reviewed for Code Compliance.” Such reviewed

construction documents shall not be changed, modified or
altered without authorization from the code official. Work
shall be done in accordance with the approved construction
documents. One set of construction documents so reviewed

shall be retained by the code official. The other set shall

Page 32 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1508.html#15.08.050

be returned to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of
work and shall be open to inspection by the code official

or a duly authorized representative.

The code official shall have the authority to issue a
permit for the construction of part of a mechanical system
before the construction documents for the entire system
have been submitted or approved, provided adequate
information and detailed statements have been filed
complying with all pertinent requirements of this code. The
holder of such permit shall proceed at his or her own risk
without assurance that the permit for the entire mechanical

system will be granted.

5. Amend Section 106.4.3 Expiration. Every permit issued by

the code official under the provisions of this code shall

expire by limitation and become null and void if the work

authorized by such permit is not commenced within 365 days

from the date of such permit, or if the work authorized by

such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the

work is commenced for a period of 365 days. Before such

work recommences, [a—mnew—or] permit shall be first obtained

and the fee therefor shall be one-half the amount required

for a new permit for such work, provided that changes have

Page 33 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



not been made and will not be made in the original

construction documents for such work, and provided further

that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one

year.

6. Amend Section 106.4.4 Extensions. A permittee holding an

unexpired permit shall have the right to apply for an

extension of the time within which the permittee will

commence work under that permit where work is unable to be

commenced within the time required by this section for good

and satisfactory reasons. The code official shall extend

the time for action by the permittee for a period not

exceeding 365 days if there is reasonable cause. A permit

shall not be extended more than once. The fee for an

extension shall be one-half the amount required for a new

permit for such work.

7. Amend Section 106.4.7 Previous approvals. This code

shall not require changes in the construction documents,

construction and designated occupancy of a structure for

which a lawful permit has been heretofore issued or

otherwise lawfully authorized, and the construction of

which has been pursued in good faith within 365 days after

the effective date of this code and has not been abandoned.

Page 34 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



+4+_8.Amend Section 106.5.2, Fee schedule. A fee for each
permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the

Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.030(E), as said section

currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified or

remodified.

+5] 9.Amend Section 106.5.3, Fee refunds. The code official
shall authorize the refunding of fees as [fellewss] based

on administrative provision of the International Building

Code, Chapter 15.08 Redmond Municipal Code.

[6] 10.Amend Section 108.4, Violation penalties. Any person
who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply
with any of the requirements thereof or who erects,
constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure
mechanical system in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the building official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this
code, shall be subject to the penalties provided for in

Redmond Municipal Code 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14 Redmond

Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

+#] 1ll.Added Section 109, Means of Appeal. Appeals of

orders, decisions or determinations made by the Building

Page 35 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



Official related to the application or interpretation of

this code shall be made pursuant to Redmond Zoning Code

Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of Type I and II Permits, as

said section currently exists or is hereafter amended,

modified or recodified.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.
2596 § 2 (part), 2011; Ord. 2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5

(part), 2004)

15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code.

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas Code

adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1.Add new Chapter 1, Administration. The amended

administrative provisions of the International Mechanical

Code, Redmond Municipal Code 15.14.050, shall apply.

(Ord. 2833 § 3 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 4 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

15.14.070 Penalties for wviolations.

Page 36 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects,
constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure mechanical
system in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the Building Official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and
Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified. (Ord. 2833 § 3
(part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 6 (part), 2014: Ord. 2346 § 4 (part),

2007: Ord. 2219 § 5 (part), 2004)

Chapter 15.16

PLUMBING CODE*

Sections:

15.16.010 Short title.

15.16.020 Adoption.

15.16.030 Public inspection.

15.16.040 Deletions.

15.16.050 Amendments.

Page 37 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.010
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.020
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.030
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.040
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.050

15.16.060 Penalties for violations.

*Prior legislation: Ords. 1926, 2014 and 2215. Formerly Chapter

20E.70 RCDG.

15.16.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute the
“Plumbing Code” of the City and may be cited as such. (Ord. 2833
§ 4 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part), 2014: Ord. 2346 § 5

(part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 6 (part), 2004)

15.16.020 Adoption.

The Uniform Plumbing Code, [26+5] 2018 Edition, published
by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials, together with the additions, deletions and exceptions
as set forth in Chapter 51-56 WAC, are hereby adopted by this
reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in full as the
Plumbing Code for the City, except such portions as may be

deleted, modified or amended by this chapter.

The Building Official may use the appendices for guidance in

interpreting and administering the Plumbing Code and the

Page 38 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1516.html#15.16.060
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-56

provisions of this chapter. Further, the following appendix

chapters are specifically adopted:

Appendix A, Sizing the Water Supply System;

Appendix B, Explanatory Notes on Combination Waste and

Vent Systems;

Appendix I, Installation Standards.

(Ord. 2833 § 4 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part), 2014: Ord.

2346 § 5 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 6 (part), 2004)

15.16.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the City
Clerk, for reference by the general public, not less than one
copy of the codes and resolutions, or parts thereof, as herein
adopted by reference, together with the amendments and

supplements thereto herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the City Clerk

in the custody of the Building Official in order to make them

Page 39 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



more readily available for inspection and use by the general
public. (Ord. 2833 § 4 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part), 2014:

Ord. 2346 § 5 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 6 (part), 2004)

15.16.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the Uniform Plumbing Code, [2845+

2018 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Section 104.3.2 - Plan Review Fees.

2. Table 104.5 - Plumbing Permit Fees.

3. Chapters 12 and 15, plus those requirements of the
Uniform Plumbing Code relating to venting and combustion
air of fuel-fired appliances found in Chapter 5 and those
portions of the code addressing building sewers (WAC 51-56-
003). (Ord. 2833 § 4 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part),

2014: Ord. 2346 § 5 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 6 (part),

2004)

15.16.050 Amendments.

Page 40 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-56-003
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-56-003

The following sections of the Uniform Plumbing Code adopted

by this chapter are hereby amended to read as follows:

1. Amend Section 104.3.3 Time Limitation of Application.

Applications for which no permit is issued within [+86]_ 365 days
following the date of application shall expire by limitation,
plans and other data submitted for review, thereafter, shall be
returned to the applicant or destroyed by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction. The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be
permitted to exceed the time for action by the applicant for a
period not to exceed [+88] 365 days upon request by the
applicant showing that circumstances beyond the control of the
applicant have prevented the action from begin taken. No
application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew
action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall

resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.

2. Amend Section 104.4.3 Expiration. A permit issued by the

Authority Having Jurisdiction under the provisions of this code
shall expire by limitation and become null and void where the
work authorized by such permit is not commenced within {+3+86] 365
days from the date of such permit, or where the work authorized
by such permit is suspended or abandoned at a time after the

work is commenced for a period of [+88] 365 days. Before such

Page 41 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



work is recommenced, a [mew} permit shall first be obtained to
do so, and the fee, therefore, shall be one-half the amount
required for a new permit for such work, provided no changes
have been made or will be made in the original construction
documents for such work, and provided further that such

suspension or abandonment has not exceeded 1 year.

3. Amend Section 104.4.4 Extensions. A permittee holding an

unexpired permit shall be permitted to apply for an extension of
the time within which work shall be permitted to commence under
that permit where the permittee is unable to commence work
within the time required by this section. The Authority Having
Jurisdiction shall be permitted to extend the time for action by
the permittee for a period not exceeding [+86] 365 days upon
written request by the permittee showing that circumstances
beyond the control of the permittee have prevented the action
from being taken. No permit shall be extended more than once

unless authorized by the Building Official. In order to renew

action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay one

half of permit fees for a new permit [a—rmew full permit—Ffecel.

[3]_4.Amend Section 104.5, Fees. A fee for each permit

shall be paid as required, in accordance with the Redmond Zoning

Page 42 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



Code Section 21.76.030(E), as said chapter currently exists or

is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

+4+ 5.Amend Section 104.5.3, Fee Refunds. Section 108.6

Refunds of the administrative provisions of the International

Building Code, Chapter 15.08 Redmond Municipal Code, shall

apply.

[+] 6.Amend Section 106.3, Penalties. Any person who
violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or
repairs a building or structure plumbing system in violation of
the approved construction documents or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the
provisions of this code, shall be subject to the penalties

provided for in Redmond Municipal Code 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14

Redmond Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is

hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

[2] _7.Amend Section 107.0, Board of Appeals. Appeals of
orders, decisions or determinations made by the Building
Official related to the application or interpretation of this

code shall be made pursuant to Redmond Zoning Code Section

21.76.060(I), Appeals of Type I and II Permits, as said section

Page 43 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.



currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified or

recodified.

(Ord. 2833 § 4 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part), 2014: Ord.
2596 § 2 (part), 2011; Ord. 2346 § 5 (part), 2007: Ord. 2219 § 6

(part), 2004)

15.16.060 Penalties for violations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects,
constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure plumbing
system in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the building official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and
Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified. (Ord. 2833 § 4
(part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 7 (part), 2014: Ord. 2346 § 5 (part),

2007: Ord. 2219 § 6 (part), 2004)

Chapter 15.18

Energy Code

Page 44 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14

Sections:

15.18.010 Short title.

15.18.020 Adoption.

15.18.030 Public inspection.
15.18.040 Deletions.

15.18.050 Amendments.

15.18.060 Penalties for wviolations.

*Prior legislation: Ords. 1926, 2014, and 2215. Formerly Chapter

20E.50 RCDG.

15.18.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute the
“Energy Code” of the City and may be cited as such. (Ord. 2833
§ 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8 (part), 2014: Ord. 2219 § 7

(part), 2004)

15.18.020 Adoption.

The Washington State Energy Code, [2645] 2018 version,
Chapter 51-11C and 51-11R of the Washington Administrative Code,

is hereby adopted by this reference and incorporated herein as

Page 45 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.010
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.020
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.030
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.040
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.050
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond15/Redmond1518.html#15.18.060
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-11C
https://www.codepublishing.com/cgi-bin/wac.pl?cite=51-11R

if set forth in full as the Energy Code for the City, except
such portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by this
chapter. (Ord. 2833 § 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8 (part),

2014: Ord. 2346 § 6, 2007; Ord. 2219 § 7 (part), 2004)

15.18.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the City
Clerk, for reference by the general public, not less than one
copy of the codes and resolutions, or parts thereof, as herein
adopted by reference, together with the amendments and

supplements thereto herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the City
Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in order to make
them more readily available for inspection and use by the
general public. (Ord. 2833 § 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8

(part), 2014: Ord. 2219 § 7 (part), 2004)

15.18.040 Deletions.

There are no deletions to the Washington State Energy Code.

(Ord. 2833 § 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8 (part), 2014: Ord.

2219 § 7 (part), 2004)

Page 46 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



15.18.050 Amendments.

There are no amendments to the Washington State Energy

Code.

(Ord. 2833 § 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8 (part), 2014: Ord.

2219 § 7 (part), 2004)

15.18.060 Penalties for violations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects,
constructs, alters or repairs a building or structure in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of
the Building Official, or of a permit or certificate issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to the
penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as
salid section currently exists or is hereafter amended, modified

or recodified.

(Ord. 2833 § 5 (part), 2016: Ord. 2729 § 8 (part), 2014: Ord.

2219 § 7 (part), 2004)

Section 3. Severability. If any section, sentence, clause or

phrase of this ordinance should be held to be invalid or unconstitutional

Page 47 of 49 Ordinance No.

AM No.


https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0101.html#1.01.110
https://www.codepublishing.com/WA/Redmond/municode/Redmond01/Redmond0114.html#1.14

by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality

of any other section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance.

Section 4. Effective date. A summary of this ordinance shall

be published in the «city’s official newspaper, or as otherwise

provided by law, and shall take effect on February 1, 2021.

ADOPTED by the Redmond City Council this day of

, 20XX.

CITY OF REDMOND

ANGELA BIRNEY, MAYOR

ATTEST:

CHERYL XANTHOS, MMC, CITY CLERK (SEAL)

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Page 48 of 49 Ordinance No.
AM No.



JAMES HANEY, CITY ATTORNEY

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK:

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL:
SIGNED BY THE MAYOR:
PUBLISHED:

EFFECTIVE DATE:

ORDINANCE NO.

Page 49 of 49

Ordinance No.
AM No.



